24 June 2024

Request

Grouville Parish Hall is due to have its grand opening on Sunday, June 2nd. Once this event has occurred,
please could you provide the guest-list and the total cost of the event including donations or benefits in kind.
In addition, please provide any email correspondence pertaining to the Opening and any public
advertisement.

Response

Guest list — this information is not held; an open invitation was extended to all Grouville Parishioners to view
the newly refurbished Parish Hall.
FOI exemption applied:
Article 10 - Obligation of scheduled public authority to confirm or deny holding information
(1) Subject to paragraph (2), if —
(a) a person makes a request for information to a scheduled public authority; and
(b) the authority does not hold the information, it must inform the applicant accordingly

Total cost — £590.62 for refreshments (no donations/benefits in kind).

Email correspondence pertaining to arrangements for the event and notification to members of the
municipality is below.
FOI exemption applied:

Article 25(2) - Personal Information - Personal data, applicant not subject but supply
contravenes data protection principles

Information is absolutely exempt information if — (a) it constitutes personal data of which the applicant
is not the data subject as defined in the Data Protection (Jersey) Law 2018; and (b) its supply to a
member of the public would contravene any of the data protection principles, as defined in that Law.

Public advertisements — invitations were extended through the Parish website news page and Facebook (see
below). The Parish website News and Events page includes a sign-up option whereby the Parish sends news
and event information by email the evening it is posted on the website (currently over 200 subscribers to this
service).
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REFURBISHED PARISH HALL
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The Connétable would like to invite all Grouville Parishioners to view the newly refurbished Parish Hall on Sunday, 2nd June
at 3.00 p.m.

Light refreshments will be served.

We look forward to seeing you all there.
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From:

Sent: Monday, May 20, 2024 1:18 PM

To: Drew Livingston

Subject: Parish Hall Open Day

Hi Drew

The opening day of the hall is due to take place on Sunday, 02 June at 15:00 and Mark has asked
if you could please advise the Honorary Police that they are all invited to attend with their
partners.

Thank you.

Kind regards

Grouville Parish Hall
La Rue A Don, Grouville, Jersey, JE3 9GA

B Tel: 01534 852225 | & Email: |
é Think of the environment...do you need to print this e-mail?
From: Peter Le Cuirot
Sent: Monday, May 27, 2024 7:18 PM
To:
Subject: Open day
Hi
If the open day hasn't gone live please wait until John and | see you Tuesday morning.

It's all ok but maybe the following Sunday might be better. John doesn't know my
thinking but on Friday he said Stanley, David, and himself won't be able to attend

Senior Proc needs to make a speach
Kind regards

Peter Le Cuirot



From:

Sent: Tuesday, May 28, 2024 8:39 AM
To: Peter Le Cuirot

Subject: RE: Open day

Morning Peter
Nothing has been mentioned on social media, however | am not sure if Mark has published an
article for the gazette summer issue. Some municipality members have received invites and I'm

aware Mark has invited numerous other people, such as the Battle of Flowers, deputies etc.

My current concern this morning is that the flat roof was not covered over the weekend and the
rain has leaked through the ceiling and all over the kitchen and corridor next to the toilets!

W Horn Brothers have been contacted to sort this urgently.

Kind regards

Grouville Parish Hall
La Rue A Don, Grouville, Jersey, JE3 9GA

From:

Sent: Tuesday, May 28, 2024 12:54 PM
To: Stanley Payn

Cc:

Subject: Parish Hall Grand Opening

Good afternoon Stanley

The Procureurs have confirmed that the grand opening will be going ahead this Sunday 2™ June
at 3pm.

Could you please confirm what time the sandwiches are due to be dropped off at the Parish
Hall and will make sure someone is here to accept them.

Many thanks and kind regards

Grouville Parish Hall
T:01534-852225 | E: parishhall@grouyille.je

From: Grouville <ParishHall@grouville.je>
Sent: Wednesday, May 29, 2024 10:00 AM
To:

Subject: Grand Hall Opening

Hi

Have spoken to Stanley and he confirms being asked to cater for 50 people. He will drop off 5
trays of sandwiches and some canapes on Sunday at 2pm.

Could you please advise who will be meeting him here with their contact telephone number.
Kind regards

Parish Administrator
Grouville Parish Hall

T:01534-852225 | E: parishhall@grouville.je



From:

Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2024 9:03:11 am
To:

Subject: Message from John L'Amy

Hi

John rang and said Mark Labey has asked that the event on Sunday be advertised on our
website and also to email the Municipality separately to advise them of this.

Kind regards

Grouville Parish Hall

T:01534-852225 | E: parishhall@grouville.je

From:

Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2024 10:44 AM
To:

Subject: Fwd: Message from John L'Amy

Morning!

Please could you put something on the web for the opening day and let the roads
inspectors know. All other municipality should be aware.

Thank you! Hope everything is ok at the office.

Kind regards

From: Grouville <ParishHall@grouville.je>

Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2024 11:45 AM

To: Grouville <ParishHall@grouville.je>

Subject: Opening of the Newly Refurnished Parish Hall

Good Morning

The Connétable would like to invite all Members of the Municipality and Deputies to view the
newly refurbished Parish Hall on Sunday, 2" June at 3.00 p.m.

Light refreshments will be served.

We look forward to seeing you all there.
Kind Regards

Customer Service Team

Grouville Parish Hall
La Rue A Don, Grouville, Jersey, JE3 9GA

2 Tel: 01534 852225
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